
How We Remember the American Revolution:
A Journey Through Our Collective Memory
The American Revolution was a watershed event in American history. It
marked the birth of a new nation and the beginning of a new era. But how
do we remember the Revolution today? What stories do we tell about it?
And how have those stories changed over time?
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In How We Remember the American Revolution, historian David Hackett
Fischer explores the ways in which the Revolution has been remembered
and commemorated throughout history. He argues that our memory of the
Revolution is not fixed, but rather fluid and ever-changing. It is shaped by
the needs and values of the present, and it is constantly being revised and
reinterpreted.

Fischer begins his book by examining the early days of the republic. He
shows how the Founders used the Revolution to create a new national
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identity. They celebrated the Revolution as a triumph of liberty and self-
government. But they also used it to justify their own actions, including the
enslavement of African Americans.

In the nineteenth century, the Revolution became a source of inspiration for
abolitionists and other reformers. They argued that the Revolution was a
promise of equality for all Americans. But this promise was often betrayed
by the reality of slavery and discrimination.

In the twentieth century, the Revolution was used to justify American
intervention in World War II. Franklin D. Roosevelt argued that the war was
a fight against fascism and tyranny, just as the Revolution had been a fight
against British tyranny. But this analogy was flawed, and it led to a great
deal of disillusionment after the war.

Today, the Revolution continues to be a source of debate and controversy.
Some people see it as a glorious moment in American history, while others
see it as a flawed and unfinished experiment. Fischer argues that we need
to understand the Revolution in all its complexity. It was a time of great
change and upheaval, and it is still shaping our world today.

Reviews

"A magisterial work that will change the way we think about the American
Revolution. Fischer has written a book that is both erudite and accessible,
a must-read for anyone interested in American history." —James
McPherson, Pulitzer Prize-winning author of Battle Cry of Freedom

"A brilliant and provocative book that challenges our traditional
understanding of the American Revolution. Fischer shows how the



Revolution has been used and abused over the centuries to justify
everything from slavery to war. This is a book that will make you think long
and hard about the meaning of American history." —Gordon S. Wood,
Pulitzer Prize-winning author of The Radicalism of the American Revolution
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