
Before There Were Words: A Journey to the
Roots of Human Communication

The ability to communicate is one of the defining characteristics of the
human species. We use language to share ideas, express emotions, and
build relationships. But how did this extraordinary ability come to be? In her
groundbreaking book, "Before There Were Words: The Origins of Human
Communication," author Jennifer Redmond takes us on a fascinating
journey to explore the preverbal roots of our communication systems.

The Gestural Origins of Communication
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Before the advent of spoken language, humans relied on a variety of
gestural cues to communicate. These gestures included body postures,
facial expressions, and hand movements. Redmond argues that these
gestures were not simply a way to express emotion but also served as a
proto-language, allowing our ancestors to exchange complex ideas and
information.

She provides compelling evidence from studies of contemporary gestural
languages, such as American Sign Language, which demonstrates that
gestures can convey a wide range of meanings and can even be used to
tell stories and transmit knowledge. This suggests that our early ancestors
may have had a sophisticated gestural communication system that
preceded the development of spoken language.

The Evolution of Vocal Communication

While gestures were likely the primary means of communication in early
human cultures, vocal communication also played a significant role.
Redmond explores the evidence for the gradual evolution of human
vocalizations, from simple grunts and calls to more complex vocalizations
with specific meanings.

She discusses the concept of "vocal gestures," which were likely the
precursors to speech. These vocal gestures were short, non-lexical sounds
that conveyed specific meanings, such as a grunt to indicate agreement or
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a sharp sound to indicate alarm. Over time, these vocal gestures may have
become more elaborated and structured, eventually evolving into the
complex spoken languages we use today.

The Multimodal Nature of Communication

Redmond emphasizes that communication was never solely gestural or
vocal but rather a multimodal experience that drew upon a combination of
sensory channels. She argues that early humans likely used gestures,
vocalizations, and facial expressions in a coordinated manner to convey
complex messages.

This multimodal approach to communication allowed for greater flexibility
and expressiveness, enabling our ancestors to communicate in a variety of
contexts and situations. Even today, we rely on multimodal cues when we
communicate, such as gestures, tone of voice, and facial expressions, to
convey our intentions and emotions.

The Cognitive and Cultural Context of Communication

Redmond also explores the cognitive and cultural factors that shaped the
evolution of communication. She argues that communication is not simply a
biological phenomenon but is also fundamentally shaped by our social and
cultural contexts.

She discusses the role of cognitive abilities, such as joint attention and
theory of mind, in facilitating the development of communication. She also
explores the influence of cultural norms and values on the way that we use
and interpret communicative cues.



Implications for Understanding Human Nature

The insights gained from studying the origins of communication have
profound implications for our understanding of human nature. By
uncovering the preverbal roots of our communicative abilities, we gain a
deeper appreciation for the complexity and richness of human interaction.

"Before There Were Words" challenges us to question our assumptions
about how we communicate and opens up new avenues for research in
fields ranging from anthropology and linguistics to cognitive science and
communication theory.

Jennifer Redmond's "Before There Were Words" is a groundbreaking work
that offers a comprehensive and fascinating account of the origins of
human communication. Through a combination of historical evidence,
anthropological studies, and cognitive science research, Redmond
provides a compelling case for the importance of gestural and vocal
communication in the evolution of our language abilities.

By delving into the preverbal roots of our communication systems, we gain
a deeper understanding of the human experience and the nature of our
social connections. "Before There Were Words" is a must-read for anyone
interested in the origins of language, the evolution of human cognition, and
the fundamental nature of human communication.
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